
 



 



 



 

Summary in English
The educational field is one of the most important areas of interest to 
social workers, because it accommodates large numbers of members of 
society, amounting to several million, and this number is not available in 
any other field of human life, in addition to the institutions that work in 
this field whose role is not limited to Providing students with knowledge 
related to a specific group of sciences, but its role goes far beyond that, as 
this role includes contributing positively to the growth of students and 
achieving social maturity for them,this study belongs to the type of 
descriptive analytical studies, this study relied on the use of the 
comprehensive social survey method for all social workers working in 
secondary schools in the East and West Fayoum Educational 
Administrations, and their number was (113) social workers, in collecting 
data from the field, the researcher relied on a measurement from on " the 
school environment and its relationship to the level of commitment 
directed to social workers in the school field, all secondary schools 
(general technical) in the East and West Fayoum Educational 
Administration, and their number (32) secondary schools, including (16) 
secondary schools (public-technical) in the East Fayoum Educational 
Administration and (16) secondary schools (public-technical) in the West 
Fayoum Educational Administration, the results of the study indicate that 
the directed commitment was approved by a large percentage.  
Opening Words: School Environment - Directed Commitment.
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